
NEW YORK STATE 

DIVISION OF CRIMINAL JUSTICE SERVICES 

GRANT CONTRACT 

APPENDIX A-1 

This Contract is hereby made by and between the State of New York acting by and through the New York State Division of 
Criminal Justice Services (DCJS or State Agency) and the public or private entity (Contractor) identified on the face page 
hereof (Face Page). 

WITNESSETH: 

WHEREAS, the State has the authority to regulate and provide funding for the establishment and operation of program 
services, design or the execution and performance of construction projects, as applicable and desires to contract with skilled 
parties possessing the necessary resources to provide such services or work, as applicable, and 

WHEREAS, the Contractor is ready, willing, and able to provide such program services or the execution and performance of 
construction projects and possesses or can make available all necessary qualified personnel licenses, facilities and expertise to 
perform or have performed the services or work, as applicable, required pursuant to the terms of the Contract, 

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the promises, responsibilities, and covenants herein, the State and the Contractor 
agree as follows: 

STATE STANDARD TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

I. GENERAL PROVISIONS

A. Executory Clause: In accordance with Section 41 of the State Finance Law, the State shall have no liability under this
Contract to the Contractor or to anyone else beyond funds appropriated and available for the Contract.

B. Required Approvals: In accordance with Section 112 of the State Finance Law ( or, if the Contract is with the State
University of New York (SUNY) or City University of New York (CUNY), Section 355 or Section 6218 of the Education Law), if
the Contract exceeds $50,000 (or the minimum thresholds agreed to by the Office of the State Comptroller for certain S.U.N.Y.
and C.U.N.Y. contracts), or if this is an amendment for any amount to a contract which, as so amended, exceeds said statutory
amount, or if, by the contract, the State agrees to give something other than money when the value or reasonably estimated
value of such consideration exceeds $25,000, it shall not be valid, effective or binding upon the State until it has been approved
by the State Comptroller and filed in his office. Comptroller's approval of contracts let by the Office of General Services is















































































Participating police departments will develop writing protocols detailing established procedures to notify the SNUG program 
manager or his/her designee of all shootings and/or homicides within 24 hours of each incident. The written procedures must 
be submitted to DCJS with the first Quarterly Progress Report. 

Participating police departments will provide DCJS an annual report detailing a year to year comparison of shootings and 
homicides for the current GIVE Contract period and the two preceding GIVE Contract periods for the target area(s) and the 
entire city. This annual comprehensive report will be due on the last day of the month following the expiration date of the 
Contract. 

Motor Vehicle Theft and Insurance Fraud (MVTIF) Program 

The Contractor shall expend funds in a manner that is consistent with the MVT/MVIF Plans of Operation 

New York State Defenders Association (NYSDA). 

Any income, including interest, arising from state funds paid to the NYSDA shall be used to pay for the cost or expansion of 
tasks to be performed as part of the NYSDA's programs or projects, provided that all such income shall first be used to 
reimburse the NYSDA for monies expended from its general fund to support the Backup Center services. 

Whenever possible, the NYSDA and its employees shall seek state rates for travel, meals, and lodging. Where such rates are 
not obtainable, NYSDA employees must provide three quotes demonstrating reasonableness of price for alternate travel, 
meals, and lodging, except when seeking lodging at the venue of a conference essential to the NYSDA program. In which case 
the NYSDA shall document the conference arrangements and rates for travel, meals, and lodging. 

Upon DCJS request, the NYSDA will arrange for DCJS personnel to attend the NYSDA trainings and conferences offered for 
the purposes of program and contract monitoring. The parties of this Contract understand that nothing in this Contract shall be 
construed to preclude or impair the right of the NYSDA attorneys to act in the best interest of their clients. In providing access to 
records and submitting reports required pursuant to the provisions of this Contract, the NYSDA shall, in accordance with its 
professional responsibility under the New York Rules of Professional Conduct (see 22 NYCRR Pt. 1200), protect the 
confidences and secrets of its clients, including the clients of the attorneys to whom the NYSDA provided assistance or 
services. No record or report shall be deemed deficient because of the omission of information, the provision of which would 
result in the disclosure of any such confidences or secrets or would otherwise compromise the interest of any client. 

In serving as the Public Defense Backup Center and a clearing house for information realting to the provision of public defense 
services, NYSDA will review, assess, and analyze the public defense system and advnace the rights and interests of public 
defense clients and public defense attorneys. 
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